wacobs

Jacobs No: E2X97908 Prepared by: J. Pelletier
AIP No.: 3-33-0011-TBD-2026 Reviewed by: N. Deres
Subject: Tabulation of Bid Values
Date/Time: 4/17/2026 @ 2:00 PM
Airport: Manchester-Boston Regional Airport
Project: Purchase SRE Equipment
Smart Manufacturing Fortbrand Services M-B Companies Wausau
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION BID QTY | UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL
Multi-Tasking Snow Removal Unit to include
1 Carrier Vehicle, Snow Plow, Rotary Broom and 2 EA No Bid No Bid! $1,740,000.00 $3,480,000.00 $1,129,102.88 $2,258,205.76 No Bid No Bid
High Velocity Air blast
2 Carrier Vehicle with Spreader 1 EA No Bid No Bid! $620,000.00 $620,000.00 No Bid No Bid $478,582.00 $478,582.00
3 Liquid Deice Truck 1 EA $589,750.00 $589,750.00 $679,481.00 $679,481.00 No Bid No Bid $702,784.00 $702,784.00
W-01-01 ::AYreEar Manufacturer’s Extended Warranty - 2 EA No Bid No Bid $60,000.00 $120,000.00 $76,331.45 $152,662.90 No Bid No Bid
W-01-02 3 Ye.ar Manyfactu_rer s Extended Warranty - 1 EA No Bid No Bid $10,500.00 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid $9,595.00 $9,595.00
Carrier Vehicle with Spreader
W-01-03 3 .Ye‘jir Ma.nUfacmrer s Extended Warranty - 1 EA $6,550.00 $6,550.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 No Bid No Bid $15,675.00 $15,675.00
Liquid Deice Truck
Low Bid Subtotal: $589,750.00] Low Bid Subtotal: $620,000.00] Low Bid Subtotal: $2,258,205.76] Low Bid Subtotal: N/A|
Additive Alternate Additive Alternate Additive Alternate Additive Alternate
Subtotal: $6,550.00 Subtotal: $10,500.00 Subtotal: $152,662.90 Subtotal: $0.00
Total Bid $ 596,300.00 Total Bid $ 630,500.00 Total Bid $ 2,410,868.66 Total Bid $0.00)

Apparent Low Bid



